
 

Customs (Use of Computer) (Amendment) Regulations 2007

GN No. 173 of 2007 
Government Gazette of Mauritius No. 97 of 12 October 2007

THE CUSTOMS ACT

Regulations made by the Minister under section 163 of the Customs Act

1. These regulations may be cited as the Customs (Use of Computer) (Amendment) Regulations 2007. 

2. In these regulations - 

"principal regulations" means the Customs (Use of Computer) Regulations 1997. 

3. The principal regulations are amended - 

(a) in regulation 16 - 

(i) in paragraph (3) - 

(A) by deleting the words "12 months" and replacing them by the words "3 months";

(B) in subparagraph (a) - 

(I) in subparagraph (x), by deleting the figure "14" and replacing it by the figure 

"21"; 

(ll) by revoking subparagraph (xi); 

(C) by revoking subparagraph (c); 

(D) by adding immediately after subparagraph (d), the following new subparagraph, the 

full stop at the end of subparagraph (d) being deleted and replaced by a semi colon - 

(e) the internal control system of the TradeNet user. 

(ii) in paragraph (4) - 

(A) by deleting the words "12 months" and replacing them by the words "3 months"; 



 

(B) by deleting the words ", cheques, payment instructions and"; 

(iii) in paragraph (5), by deleting the words ", the TradeNet user shall" and replacing them by the 

words "and the TradeNet user has been discharging his obligations under the Revenue 

Laws as defined in the Mauritius Revenue Authority Act 2004, he shall"; 

(b) in regulation 23, in paragraph (2), by deleting the words "100,000 rupees" and replacing them by the 

words "200,000 rupees and to imprisonment for a term not exceeding 5 years". 

Made by the Minister on 4th October 2007. 


